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20-20037
F281-629 (Rev. 5/92)

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Emergency Contract for the Purchase of Large Diameter Ductile
FOR: Iron Pipe, Repair Couplings, MJ Sleeves and CSC Adapters
TIME &  
DATE: 3:00 p.m., April 17, 2020  
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

GROUP 1 - PIPE  
40 Feet UNIT
30" DI Pipe, "Fastite" Joint Gauge Full Length, Class 150 PRICE 97.05 109.07 114.37 111.35 115.31 NO BID NO BID NO BID

1. SAWS No. 47437 TOTAL 3,882.00 4,362.80 4,574.80 4,454.00 4,612.40    
40 Feet UNIT
36" DI Pipe, "Fastite" Joint Gauge Full Length, Class 150 PRICE 129.81 149.75 155.55 152.00 158.32 NO BID NO BID NO BID

2. SAWS No. 47438 TOTAL 5,192.40 5,990.00 6,222.00 6,080.00 6,332.80    
40 Feet UNIT
42" DI Pipe, "Fastite" Joint Gauge Full Length, Class 150 PRICE 195.16 206.99 192.56 211.00 218.85 NO BID NO BID NO BID

3. SAWS No. 47439 TOTAL 7,806.40 8,279.60 7,702.40 8,440.00 8,754.00    
40 Feet UNIT
48" DI Pipe, "Fastite" Joint Gauge Full Length, Class 150 PRICE 248.06 296.00 270.15 302.00 312.96 NO BID NO BID NO BID

4. SAWS No. 47440 TOTAL 9,922.40 11,840.00 10,806.00 12,080.00 12,518.40    
 *
         

 TOTAL GROUP 1 TOTAL 26,803.20 30,472.40 29,305.20 31,054.00 32,217.60 NO BID NO BID NO BID
GROUP 2 - MJ SLEEVES  
4 Each UNIT
Sleeve MJ Solid Long, Size: 30 Inch, Ductile Wide Body PRICE 937.54 937.55 1,089.90 947.00 6,100.00 NO BID NO BID 880.04

1. SAWS No. 47542 TOTAL 3,750.16 3,750.20 4,359.60 3,788.00 24,400.00   3,520.16
4 Each UNIT
Sleeve MJ Solid Long, Size: 36 Inch, Ductile Wide Body PRICE 1,288.58 1,316.31 1,530.20 1,330.00 7,000.00 NO BID NO BID 1,235.57

2. SAWS No. 47543 TOTAL 5,154.32 5,265.24 6,120.80 5,320.00 28,000.00   4,942.28
4 Each UNIT
Sleeve MJ Solid Long, Size: 42 Inch, Ductile Wide Body PRICE 1,555.04 1,760.09 1,841.35 1,779.00 10,000.00 NO BID NO BID 1,652.13

3. SAWS No. 47544 TOTAL 6,220.16 7,040.36 7,365.40 7,116.00 40,000.00   6,608.52
4 Each UNIT
Sleeve MJ Solid Long, Size: 48 Inch, Ductile Wide Body PRICE 2,184.39 2,472.44 2,586.50 2,499.00 12,600.00 NO BID NO BID 2,320.78

4. SAWS No. 47545 TOTAL 8,737.56 9,889.76 10,346.00 9,996.00 50,400.00   9,283.12
  *
          

 TOTAL GROUP 2 TOTAL 23,862.20 25,945.56 28,191.80 26,220.00 142,800.00 NO BID NO BID 24,354.08
GROUP 3 - COUPLINGS  
4 Each UNIT
Couplings, Size 30 Inch for DI 32.00 O.D. 10  Inch Barrel PRICE NO BID 982.04 1,166.16 1,292.00 NO BID 1,292.39 NO BID NO BID

1. SAWS No. 10951 TOTAL  3,928.16 4,664.64 5,168.00  5,169.56   
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20-20037
F281-629 (Rev. 5/92)

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Emergency Contract for the Purchase of Large Diameter Ductile
FOR: Iron Pipe, Repair Couplings, MJ Sleeves and CSC Adapters
TIME &  
DATE: 3:00 p.m., April 17, 2020  
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY A
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4 Each UNIT
Couplings, Size 36 Inch OD 38.30 STl for Ductile Iron Pipe OD PRICE NO BID 1,079.16 1,381.50 1,672.00 NO BID 1,672.83 NO BID NO BID

2. SAWS No. 10952 TOTAL  4,316.64 5,526.00 6,688.00  6,691.32   
4 Each UNIT
Coupling Cast, Size: 42 Inch, Range 44.20 - 44.50 PRICE NO BID 1,198.49 1,423.20 1,884.00 NO BID 1,884.78 NO BID NO BID

3. SAWS No. 11001 TOTAL  4,793.96 5,692.80 7,536.00  7,539.12   
4 Each UNIT
Coupling , Size 48 Inch DI OD PRICE NO BID 1,417.20 1,682.93 2,156.00 NO BID 2,156.52 NO BID NO BID

4. SAWS No. 49033 TOTAL  5,668.80 6,731.72 8,624.00  8,626.08   
   *
          

 TOTAL GROUP 3 TOTAL NO BID 18,707.56 22,615.16 28,016.00 NO BID 28,026.08 NO BID NO BID
GROUP 4 - CSC ADAPTER  
4 Each UNIT
ADAP 30 IN Bell X PE L301 CSC Concrete Steel Cylinder 32.00 PRICE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 3,771.76

1. SAWS No. 9101 TOTAL       15,087.04
4 Each UNIT
ADAP 30 IN SPIGOT X PE L301 CSC Concrete Steel Cylinder 32.00 PRICE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 3,771.76

2. SAWS No. 9102 TOTAL       15,087.04
4 Each UNIT
ADAP 36 IN Bell X PE L301 CSC Concrete Steel Cylinder 38.30 PRICE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 4,084.71

3. SAWS No. 9103 TOTAL       16,338.84
4 Each UNIT
ADAP 36 IN SPIGOT X PE L301 CSC Concrete Steel Cylinder 38.30 PRICE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 4,084.71

4. SAWS No. 9104 TOTAL       16,338.84
4 Each  
ADAP CSC Reuse36 IN SPIGOT X PE B303 CSC Concrete Steel UNIT       

 Cylinder OD 38.30 PRICE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 4,437.65
5. SAWS No. 9122 TOTAL       17,750.60

4 Each  
ADAP CSC Reuse 36 IN BELL X PE B303 CSC Concrete Steel UNIT       
Cylinder OD 38.30 PRICE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 4,437.65

6. SAWS No. 9123 TOTAL       17,750.60
4 Each UNIT
ADAP 42 IN BELL X PE L301 CSC Concrete Steel Cylinder 44.50 PRICE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 4,840.00

7. SAWS No. 9104 TOTAL       19,360.00
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SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Emergency Contract for the Purchase of Large Diameter Ductile
FOR: Iron Pipe, Repair Couplings, MJ Sleeves and CSC Adapters
TIME &  
DATE: 3:00 p.m., April 17, 2020  
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY A
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4 Each UNIT
ADAP 42 IN BELL X PE L301 CSC Concrete Steel Cylinder OD 44.50PRICE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 4,840.00

8. SAWS No. 9115 TOTAL       19,360.00
4 Each  
ADAP CSC Water 48 IN SPIGOT X PE L301 CSC Concrete Steel UNIT       
Cylinder  PRICE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 5,317.65

9. SAWS NO. 47546 TOTAL       21,270.60
4 Each UNIT
ADAP CSC Water 48 IN BELLXPE L301 CSC Concrete Steel CylinderPRICE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 5,317.65

10. SAWS No. 47547 TOTAL       21,270.60
  *
         

 TOTAL GROUP 4 TOTAL NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 179,614.16
 

Net Net Net Net Net Net Net Net
Terms 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days

 
Delivery Days 30 days 30-45 days 30 days 10 days

 * LOW BIDDER  

BID INVITATIONS E-MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:

ACT Pipe & Supply KLP Commercial LLC SAWS Website
Core & Main LP Milford
Ferguson Waterworks MSN
Fortiline Rangeline Pipeline Service
Gajeske Scruggs
Hughes Techline Pipe
Iconix Thompson Pipe Group
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